
Bid Opening Results for March 30, 2021

22005WD Sodium Hypochlorite Solution
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Buckman's $0.820000 245000 Gal $200,900.00
JCI Jones Chemicals Inc. $0.870000 245000 Gal $213,150.00
Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc. $0.779400 245000 Gal $190,953.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc. No Bid

22006WD Ferric Chloride
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. $0.291000 1500000 Lb $436,500.00
PVS Technologies, Inc. $0.319000 1500000 Lb $478,500.00
Pencco Inc. No Bid
Univar Solutions USA Inc. No Bid

22007WD Hydrated Lime
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Carmeuse Lime $0.118885 1000000 Lb $118,885.00
Greer Lime Company $0.104060 1000000 Lb $104,060.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc. No Bid

22008WD Aluminum Chlorohydrate
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Kemira Water Solutions $3.150000 50000 Gal $157,500.00
USALCO $2.728100 50000 Gal $136,405.00
Chemtrade $4.995000 50000 Gal $249,750.00
Univar Solutions USA Inc. No Bid
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