18023PW Gasoline, Heating Oil, Diesel Fuel 4/18/2017
Quantity | Base | Delivery Discount| Price Total Math Total Bid | Variance

Riggins *Note on Proposal Form for After Hour Delivery Fee of $150.00
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.4675 $0.1850 $1.6525 $33,050.00 $33,050.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0370 $1.5045 $488,962.50| $488,962.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.1850 $1.7780 $88,900.00 $88,900.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0420 $1.6350 $81,750.00 $81,750.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $0.1925 $1.8325 $45,812.50 $45,812.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0650 $1.7050 $281,325.00) $281,325.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,019,800.00

Mansfield Oil
Gasoline Small Tank 20000| $1.4675 $1.4675 NO BID #VALUE!
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0700 $1.5375 $499,687.50| $499,687.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $1.5930 NO BID #VALUE!
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0504 $1.6434 $82,170.00 $82,170.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $1.6400 NO BID #VALUE!
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0679 $1.7079 $281,803.50| $281,803.50 $0.00
Grand Total $863,661.00

Petroleum Traders *Note on Proposal Form for After Hour Delivery Fee of $200.00
Gasoline Small Tank 20000| $1.4675 $1.4675 NO BID #VALUE!
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0608 $1.5283 $496,697.50| $496,697.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $1.5930 NO BID #VALUE!
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0542 $1.6472 $82,360.00 $82,360.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $1.6400 NO BID #VALUE!
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0617 $1.7017 $280,780.50| $280,780.50 $0.00
Grand Total $859,838.00

Superior Plus Energy
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.4675 $0.2214 $1.6889 $33,778.00 $33,778.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0874 $1.5549 $505,342.50| $505,342.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.2214 $1.8144 $90,720.00 $90,720.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0874 $1.6804 $84,020.00 $84,020.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $0.2214 $1.8614 $46,535.00 $46,535.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0874 $1.7274 $285,021.00) $285,021.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,045,416.50

James River Solutions
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.4675 $0.1800 $1.6475 $32,950.00 $32,950.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0490 $1.5165 $492,862.50| $492,862.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.1800 $1.7730 $88,650.00 $88,650.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0520 $1.6450 $82,250.00 $82,250.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $0.1800 $1.8200 $45,500.00 $45,500.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0520 $1.6920 $279,180.00) $279,180.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,021,392.50

TAC Energy
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.4675 $1.4675 $29,350.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0487 $1.5162 $492,765.00) $325,001.52 $167,763.48
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $1.5930 $79,650.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $1.5930 $79,650.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $1.6400 $41,000.00 NO BID #VALUE!
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0708 $1.7108 $282,282.00) $282,289.26 -$7.26
Grand Total $1,004,697.00

Apex Petroleum
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.4675 $0.2125 $1.6800 $33,600.00 $33,600.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0820 $1.5495 $503,587.50| $503,587.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.2125 $1.8055 $90,275.00 $90,275.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0820 $1.6750 $83,750.00 $83,750.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $0.2125 $1.8525 $46,312.50 $46,312.50 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0820 $1.7220 $284,130.00| $284,130.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,041,655.00

PAPCO, Inc.
Gasoline Small Tank 20000 $1.4675 $0.3607 $1.8282 $36,564.00 $36,564.00 $0.00
Gasoline Large Tank 325000 $1.4675 $0.0676 $1.5351 $498,907.50| $498,907.50 $0.00
Heating Oil Small Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.2699 $1.8629 $93,145.00 $93,145.00 $0.00
Heating Oil Large Tank, ULS 50000 $1.5930 $0.0677 $1.6607 $83,035.00 $83,035.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Small Tank, ULSD 25000 $1.6400 $0.2096 $1.8496 $46,240.00 $46,240.00 $0.00
Diesel Fuel Large Tank, ULSD 165000| $1.6400 $0.0678 $1.7078 $281,787.00) $281,787.00 $0.00
Grand Total $1,039,678.50
Anaylsis Prepared by Phil Ceresini

Notes:

Total Math is calculated from unit price

Total Bid is as reported on Bid sheet

Variance reflects amount of difference from bid sheet
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