
Bid Opening Results for March 30, 2017

18014WD Aluminum Chlorohydrate
Unit Quantity U/M Total

GEO Specialty Chemicals 50000 Gal No Bid
Summit Chemical Produts $2.380000 50000 Gal $119,000.00
Chemtrade Chemicals $3.358000 50000 Gal $167,900.00
Kemira Water Solutions $2.290000 50000 Gal $114,500.00
USALCO $2.007300 50000 Gal $100,365.00
Reviera Enterprises $2.750000 50000 Gal $137,500.00

18015WD Ferric Chloride
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Kemira Water Solutions $0.209000 1500000 Lb $313,500.00
PVS Technologies $0.247000 1500000 Lb $370,500.00

18016WD Liquid Zink Orthophosphate
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Coyne Chemical
1A $3.989000 9000 Gal $35,901.00
1B $4.599000 3000 Gal $13,797.00

Carus Corporation
1A $4.510000 9000 Gal $40,590.00
1B $4.818000 3000 Gal $14,454.00

Shannon Chemical
1A $3.840000 9000 Gal $34,560.00
1B $4.490000 3000 Gal $13,470.00

Klenzoid Inc.
1A $5.050000 9000 Gal $45,450.00
1B $5.050000 3000 Gal $15,150.00

18017WD Sodium Hypochlorite Solution
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Colony Pool
1A 245000 Gal No Bid
1B $1.745000 5000 Gal $8,725.00

Buckman's
1A $0.763000 245000 Gal $186,935.00
1B $1.620000 5000 Gal $8,100.00

Univar USA Inc.
1A $0.880000 245000 Gal $215,600.00
1B 5000 Gal No Bid



Kuehne Chemical Co., Inc.
1A $0.829400 245000 Gal $203,203.00
1B 5000 Gal No Bid

Coyne Chemical
1A 245000 Gal No Bid
1B $2.753000 5000 Gal $13,765.00

18018WD Hydrofluorosilic Acid
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Mosiac
1A $1.540000 20000 Gal $30,800.00
1B 9000 Gal No Bid

BHS Marketing
1A $1.784000 20000 Gal $35,680.00
1B 9000 Gal No Bid

Solvay
1A $1.812900 20000 Gal $36,258.00
1B 9000 Gal No Bid

Univar USA Inc.
1A $1.660000 20000 Gal $33,200.00
1B $2.450000 9000 Gal $22,050.00

Shannon
1A $3.170000 20000 Gal $63,400.00
1B $3.220000 9000 Gal $28,980.00

Pennco, Inc.
1A $1.670000 20000 Gal $33,400.00
1B 9000 Gal No Bid

Coyne Chemical
1A 20000 Gal No Bid
1B $2.976000 9000 Gal $26,784.00

18026WD Hydrated Lime
Unit Quantity U/M Total

Carmeuse Lime $0.074660 1000000 Lb $74,660.00

Greer Industries $0.072765 1000000 Lb $72,765.00
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