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BID RESULTS

Division of Procurement & Records
Louis L. Redding City/County Building
800 N. French Street, 5th Floor, Wilmington, DE 19801

17010WD — Hydrofluorosilicic Acid

Company Bid

Mosaic Gloval Sales 1a) 1.84/gal, $36,800.00 1b) No bid

Solvay Fluorides 1a) 1.8887/gal, $37,774.00 1b) No bid

Pencco, Inc. 1a) 1.93/gal, 2.12 delivered, $42,400.00 1b) No bid

Coyne Chemical 1a) No bid 1b) 3.472/gal, $31,248.00
Univar USA 1a) 2.27/gal, $45,400.00 1b) No bid

Shannon Chemical 1a) 3.11/gal, $62,200.00 1b) 3.87 gal/$34,830.00




